

Item Number	Meeting Type	Council Meeting	Agenda Report Item	Resolution Action Item	Council Decision	Director	Comments	Time frame for Comp
11.4	OCM	22/10/2024	11.4 Draft Stretch Reconciliation Action Plan 2025-2027	That Council APPROVES the proposed 'Stretch Reconciliation Action Plan 2025-2027' deliverables, at Attachment 1, for the purpose of community consultation.	Carried 8/1	EDSD	Community Consultation will occur from 29 October – 19 November 2024. A report detailing the outcome of consultation will be presented to Council Meeting in December 2024.	
9.3	OCM	17/09/2024	Advertising of Draft Auckland Street Character Area Guidelines	PREPARES the amendments to Local Planning Policy: Character Area Guidelines as included as Attachment 2 in accordance with Schedule 2, Part 2, Clause 5(1) of the Planning and Development (Local Planning Schemes) Regulations 2015; and	Carried 8/0	EDSD	Advertising closes 21 October 2024. To be returned to Council December 2024	
10.2	OCM	20/08/2024	Advertising of Amended Policy Library and Local History Collection Policy	That Council APPROVES the proposed amendments to the Library and Local History Collection Policy, at Attachment 1, for the purpose of community consultation.	Carried 9/0	EDIE		November 2024
9.1	OCM	18/06/2024	Outcome of Advertising - Review of Heritage Management Policies	3. Council DOES NOT SUPPORT the REVOCATION of Policy No 7.6.9 Heritage Assistance Fund, included as Attachment 9 and REQUESTS Administration presents a report to Council in December 2024 on the revocation of Policy No 7.6.9 Heritage Assistance Fund, as part of the Community Funding Policy review.	Carried with Amendment	EDSD	Community Funding Policy review commenced and update presented to Council Workshop in July 2024.	December 2024
10.2		21/05/2024	Beaufort Street Precinct Area Road Safety Treatments	The draft Road Safety Implementation Plan to be presented for Council consideration by May 2025 (with progress update via Council Workshop February 2025) with delivery of works prioritised based on the treatment of severely or seriously injured crashes identified within the Highgate precinct, with the intersections of Harold Street / Beaufort Street and Chatsworth Road / Beaufort Street ranked as high priority projects;	Carried 7/1 with amendments	EDIE	Implementation Plan framework being scoped. Return to Council Workshop February 2025	February 2025
13.1	OCM	19/03/2024	Notice of Motion - Mayor Alison Xamon - Protection and Promotion of Trees on Private Land	REQUESTS that the City: 2.1 Prioritises the progress of planning controls to ensure greater protection of trees and canopy provision on private land; and 2.2 Advocates to the Western Australian Planning Commission and Minister for Planning for greater protection of trees on private land.	Carried 9/0	EDSD	Administration has and will be presenting options for planning controls at Council Workshops in May, July and October 2024. Planning controls and initiatives are intended to be presented to the November Council Meeting.	November 2024
12.4	OCM	19/03/2024	Responses to Motions Carried at the Annual General Meeting of Electors held on 1 February 2024	Motion 4.2 – Dust at Menzies Park - That Council REQUESTS Administration identifies a temporary solution to stabilise and mitigate dust on this section of verge and brings a report back to Council with a recommendation for a permanent solution by no later than March 2025.	Carried with amendment	EDIE	Investigations for alternate treatment progressing.	March 2025
10.2	OCM	12/12/2023	Response to Petition - Ellesmere Street, North Perth Parking	RECEIVES a further report at the conclusion of the collection of traffic data and public consultation.	Carried 7/0	EDIE	Traffic Warrants are underway.	December 2024
10.1	OCM	12/12/2023	Response To Petition - Corner Scarborough Beach Road and Killarney Street - Maintenance and Infrastructure	REQUESTS administration to complete a review of the location of Scarborough Beach Road and Killarney Street for improved and additional signage and if warranted, provide a concept design on road infrastructure improvements to address road safety concerns which will be included in the wider precinct wide traffic modelling for the Mount Hawthorn area.	Carried 7/0	EDIE	Traffic data and concept design to be issued for community consultation with residents and school in March 2024.	December 2024
12.4-4.2(1)	AGM	14/03/2023	Development Green Space	That Council REQUEST the CEO to present a review of the landscaping requirements in the City's Built Form Policy to Council by December 2023.	Carried En bloc	EDSD	Administration will present a review of the impact to the Built Form Policy from the R Codes amendments at the 30 July workshop, to confirm the intent to pursue a determination from the WAPC. Once the Built Form Policy has been determined Administration will undertake a further review as part of the investigation of planning controls NoM.	End 2024
12.4 - Motion 4.5	AGM	14/03/2023	Pedestrian Safety (Newcastle / Fitzgerald)	4.5.1 That the City of Vincent-addresses the safety issues for pedestrians at the corner of Fitzgerald Street and Newcastle Street in this financial year 2022/23. "" 4.5.2 That the City of Vincent places a bollard or visual deterrent to offer a pedestrian refuge and protection of the Heritage listed building on the corner Newcastle Street and Fitzgerald Street. (similar to what exists on the City of Perth side of the fore mentioned intersection).	Carried 8/0	EDIE	Improvements / modifications to the intersection of Newcastle and Fitzgerald Streets requires the collaboration of several stakeholders and is expected to take over eighteen months to achieve. The interim solution has the support of the proposer of the motion.	Mid 2025
9.7	OCM	14/09/2021	Outcomes of Advertising: Draft Precinct Structure Plan and Draft Place Plan – Leederville; and Preparation of Amendment 7 to Local Planning Scheme No. 2	RECOMMENDS that the Western Australian Planning Commission approve the modifications listed at Attachment 4 and the revised Leederville Precinct Structure Plan included as Attachment 5; subject to modifying the Public Open Space at Oxford Street Reserve to reflect Attachment 7, with the remainder of 62 Frame Court, Leederville zoned Mixed Use R-AC0;	Carried with Amendment	EDSD	SPC considered draft LPSP in May 2024 and has requested further community consultation on modifications before it is reconsidered. Presented to Council workshop in August 2024 and will be presented to a futre workshop end of 2024 / early 2025 before community consultation is undertaken	Mid 2025